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Cannabis has been legalized in Canada as of October 17, 2018. What does this mean for employers
with employees traveling to and from Canada? Can travelers from Canada to the United States with
legally purchased cannabis simply drive to a state where recreational or medical use of cannabis is
legal? The bottom line: Employers should remind employees that they cannot cross into the United
States with Canadian cannabis under any circumstances.

The framework created in Canada did not change laws regarding borders. A traveler who purchases
legal cannabis in Canada may not enter the United States with it, regardless of whether the person is
traveling to a state that has legalized marijuana. Cannabis remains illegal under federal law and
crossing any U.S. – Canada border will result in legal prosecution by the federal government. This
applies to any amount and any form of cannabis, including medical marijuana.

The same is true if one were returning to Canada with legally purchased cannabis from Canada. This
act is illegal. There is no situation where a receipt can be shown to “prove” the origin. The origin
does not matter. The act of taking cannabis across the border is illegal.

Further, for the same reasons, cannabis cannot be brought on international flights even if the flight
originated from Canada. It is expected that declaration forms on flights originating from Canada
traveling to the U.S. may include questions on cannabis. Given how relatively new the legalization
and regulation of cannabis is in Canada, travelers should expect to see and/or hear increased
questions about cannabis possession and use, generally, at the borders.

Forget bringing cannabis purchased in Canada into the U.S. Even a single past use of cannabis may
lead travelers to unforeseen legal troubles. The Canadian government warns that previous use of
cannabis could result in the traveler being denied entry to the destination country, including the U.S.
This could be a lifetime ban that may take years to sort for these noncitizens.

Certain other travelers may be inadmissible to the U.S. due to their ties to cannabis. Canadian
citizens working in the marijuana industry, for example, may be denied entry to the U.S. if they are
traveling to the U.S. for reasons related to that industry. In addition, while Canada intends
to pardon citizens with simple marijuana possession convictions, the U.S. does not recognize foreign
pardons, and so these individuals also could be deemed inadmissible to enter the U.S.
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https://help.cbp.gov/app/answers/detail/a_id/3684/kw/medical%20marijuana/session/L3RpbWUvMTU0MjM0MTc4NC9zaWQvTG03RDVXX24%3D
https://www.cbc.ca/news/politics/tasker-pot-pardons-limitations-1.4866610
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